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Printer Driver version 14.38 is released!

Document  Converter  Configuration  Manager  to  help
Administrators  configure  the  Printer  Driver  settings  for
specific user(s) or user group(s) quickly and easily.

Black Ice Software has released the Printer Driver version 14.38
including the Document Converter Configuration Manager for
the server version of the Printer Drivers to greatly simplify the
Printer Driver configuration for specific user(s) or user group(s) on
Windows Servers, Active Directory environments or on Citrix
systems.

By  using  the  Document  Converter  Configuration  Manager,
Administrators  can  configure  every  aspect  of  the  Printing
Preferences,  Disable  any  Tab(s)  on  the  user  interface  or
configure conversion profiles for any user(s) or user group(s) on
the Server, Domain or on Citrix.

The new Document Converter Configuration Manager can greatly
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simplify the Printer Driver configuration for large enterprises with
hundreds  of  computers,  since  Administrators  can  change  and
apply the  printer settings with only a few clicks and users  don’t
even have to log off and log back in on the computer, the changes
take effect immediately!

The latest release of Black Ice Printer Driver includes an updated
documentation  with  detailed  information  about  the  Document
Converter Configuration Manager to let Administrators easily take
advantage of the new utility!

The  complete  list  of  improvements  in  the  latest  Black  Ice
Printer Driver include the following:

Added Document Converter Configuration Manager for server Printer
Drivers
Updated manuals

Free Upgrades and Priority Support

Do  not  forget  to  subscribe  to  future  releases  by  purchasing
maintenance. With  an  active  maintenance subscription,  you will
receive all new releases for free! Priority email technical support is
also included in your subscription. For more information call us at
+1 (603) 882-7711 Extension 2, or sales@blackice.com.

As a special offer, if your maintenance subscription has expired or
you did not include the maintenance subscription in your original
purchase,  simply  refer  to  this  newsletter  to  renew  or  add
maintenance retroactively!

Download the latest Printer Driver

Black Ice Software, LLC 20 Broad St Nashua, NH 03064 USA
www.blackice.com Telephone: 1(603)-882-7711, Fax: 1(603)-882-1344


